
Boone County Purchasing 
Liz Palazzolo 
Senior Buyer 

613 E. Ash, Room 109 
Columbia, MO 65201 

Phone: (573) 886-4392 
Fax: (573) 886-4390 

NOTICE OF AW ARD MEMORANDUM 

TO: 
FROM: 
DATE: 
RE: 

Melinda Bobbitt, Director and File 
Liz Palazzolo, CPPO, C.P.M. 
June 28, 2024 
Award of C000830 from RFB 27-18JUN24 - Computer Hardware 
Maintenance and Repair, Term and Supply for the Boone County IT 
Department 

Request for Bid 27-18JUN24 solicited bids for Computer Hardware Maintenance and 
Repair for the Boone County IT Department. Four bids and two "No Bids" were 
received: 

1) Dynamic Advantage, Inc. of Queens, New York 
2) AMTEK Computer Services (Logix Service Inc.) of San Clemente, California 
3) The Jasper Group International, Inc. of Delray Beach, Florida 
4) NPA Computers of Holbrook, New York 
5) Marco Technologies of Jefferson City, Missouri (No Bid) 
6) TEKDOC Computers of Columbia, Missouri (No Bid) 

The bids have been reviewed by the Purchasing Department and the IT Department. 

Dynamic Advantage did not price item 4.10.17. The bidder also did not submit renewal 
percentages with their original bid but I clarified and confirmed that their renewal 
percentage price adjustment was zero-percent. IT requires that all identified equipment 
be covered. The instructions on the vendor Response and Pricing Pages directed all 
bidders to price all line items. For this reason, Dynamic Advantage's bid has been 
removed from further consideration for an award. 

For the same reason of failing to submit pricing for all line items, the bid from AMTEK 
is unacceptable because AMTEK bid "time and materials" for line items 4.10.13 through 
4.10.20 and line item 4.10.28. An hourly price was quoted but no materials pricing was 
submitted - it is not possible to compute a firm price for the items that AMTEK 
responded to in this manner. 
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NP A Computers and Jasper International bid all line items. The cost evaluation shows 
that NPA Computers is lower priced for all items at a total price of $9,075.46 compared 
to Jasper International's total price of $10,021.94. It is noted for the record that the cost 
evaluation included pricing for the original contract period and all four renewal options. 
An additional note is that Jasper International's originally submitted pricing was not 
monthly pricing; it was instead annual pricing. In order to conduct an apple-to-apple 
comparison to NPA Computer's monthly pricing, I divided the quoted annual price by 12 
to get a monthly price for Jasper International that was used in the cost evaluation. 

The award of contract C000830 has been prepared to NPA Computers of Holbrook, New 
York as the "lowest and best" bid. IT has recommended the award to NP A Computers 
(see attached e-mail from Victoria Walter of the IT Department dated 6/26/24). 

This is a Term and Supply contract for the Boone County IT Department. Payments for 
services will reference the following coding with the corresponding budgeted amounts: 

Qbject .... ;· ••·•· . . ...... 
Department Description Description ' .i:!') ?!24_ B~d_g~t Code ·• ... <f Ye· //• i I >P .•/; 

GF IT IT Equipment Service 
Hardware & Contract $720.00 

1172 Software 60051 
LEST Sheriff IT Equipment Service 

$8,082.00 
2901 Operations 60051 Contract 

R&B IT IT Equipment Service 
Hardware & Contract $960.00 

2083 Software 60051 
GF IT GIS IT Equipment Service 

$708.00 
1176 60051 Contract 

GFIT IT Equipment Service 
Facilities Contract $4,680.00 

1171 Security 60051 
911/EM IT IT Equipment Service 
Hardware & Contract $2,760.00 

2708 Software 60051 
ASRIT IT Equipment Service 

Hardware & Contract $900.00 
2012 Software 60051 

Attachments: Cost Evaluation for NPA and Jasper, and Bid Tabulation 
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Victoria Walter • Office Administrator 
Boone County Government, Missouri 
Information Technology Department 
801 E Walnut St, Room 220, Columbia MO 65201 
tel :573-886-7204 fax 573-886-4322 vwalter@boonecountymo.org 
http://www.showmeboone.com 

From: Liz Palazzolo <LPalazzolo@boonecountvmo .org> 
Sent: Tuesday, June 25, 2024 3:56 PM 
To: Julia Lutz <JLutz(dJboonecountymo.org>; Victoria Walter <VWalter@boonecountymo.org> 
Cc: Phillip Montes <prnontes@boonecountymo.org> 
Subject: RE: Clarification Request - RFB 27-18JUN24 - Computer Hardware Maintenance and Repair for the Boone 
County IT Department 

I have completed the cost evaluation and proofed it. It's attached for your review. Each bidder has their own tab- look 
for the "total" price which is balded. As you pointed out a total isn't really meaningful if a bidder didn't bid all items. 

Dynamic Advantage "No-Bid" one of the servers - line item 4.10.17. I think it's an oversight on their part but their bid 
clearly says "No Response" for the item. It's possible their pricing for 4.10.17 is the same as 4.10.16 given that NPA's 
pricing for the two servers is the same, as is Jasper's. But I wouldn't know this without having to ask for the pricing after 
bid opening which opens it up to manipulation. I did have to ask them if their renewal pricing adjustments were "zero" 
since they submitted no renewal adjustments. They came back and said "Yes," which was the only correct answer I 
could have accepted. Had they come back saying 3%, etc. - I could not have allowed submission of new pricing after bid 
opening. All this said, I can make an argument that the bid is unacceptable. Have you ever heard of this 
company? They have some impressive references but no details about contacts. 

AMTEK bid "time and materials" for several items which makes their pricing incomplete. Even given this fact , NPA's 
total is lower than AMTEK's missing several prices. I think AMTEK's bid is unacceptable. We have no idea what 
materials pricing may be based on even though AMTEK bid an hourly price for these items. 

NPA bid all items and is lower than Jasper, also bidding all items. I think NPA may be acceptable and low bid if you are 
not seeing a problem. 

Please review and let me know your thoughts. 

From: Julia Lutz <JLu tz@boonecou ntvrno.o rg> 
Sent: Tuesday, June 25, 2024 11:13 AM 
To: Liz Palazzolo <LPalazzolo@boonecountymo.org>; Victoria Walter <VWalter@boonecountymo.org> 
Cc: Phillip Montes <prnon tes@boonecountymo.org> 
Subject: RE: Clarification Request - RFB 27-18JUN24 - Computer Hardware Maintenance and Repair for the Boone 
County IT Department 

They may be the lowest but they have line items that state "No response". I'm assuming that means they can't cover 
that piece of equipment and we need all equipment listed to be covered. 
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Julia Lutz . IT Director 
Boone County Government, Missouri 
Information Technology Department 
801 E Walnut, Room 220, Columbia MO 65201 
tel 573-886-4443 fax: 573-886-4322 jlutz@boonecountymo oro 

From: Liz Palazzolo <LPalazzolo@boonecountymo.org> 
Sent: Friday, June 21, 2024 4:10 PM 
To: Victoria Walter <VWalter@boonecountymo.org>; Julia Lutz <JLutz@boonecountymo.org> 
Cc: Phillip Montes <pmontes@boonecountymo.org> 
Subject: FW: Clarification Request - RFB 27-18JUN24 - Computer Hardware Maintenance and Repair for the Boone 
County IT Department 

And here's clarification from Dynamic Advantage - I think they may be your low bid. 

From: Osa <osai@dynamicadvantage.com> 
Sent: Friday, June 21, 2024 2:54 PM 
To: Liz Palazzolo <LPalazzolo@boonecountymo.org> 
Subject: RE: Clarification Request - RFB 27-18JUN24 - Computer Hardware Maintenance and Repair for the Boone 
County IT Department 

CAUTION: This email ori&inated o~tside cif boonecountymo.org. ONLY use lin~s and attachments which are. familiar. 

Good Afternoon, 
Answer is Yes 

Thanks 

From: Liz Palazzolo <LPalazzolo@boonecountymo.org> 
Sent: Friday, June 21, 2024 3:13 PM 
To: Osa <osai@dynam icadvantage.com> 
Subject: Clarification Request - RFB 27-18JUN24 - Computer Hardware Maintenance and Repair for the Boone County IT 
Department 

Good afternoon: Is Dynamic Advantage bidding a 0% increase for each of the four renewal options? 

Liz Palazzolo - Senior Buyer 
Boone County Missouri Purchasing 
5551 5. Tom Bass Road 
Columbia, MO 65201 
Direct Phone: 573-886-4392 
/po la zzul 01.il?/Juo11ew11 ntin n ci. or~ 

Virus-free.www.avast.com 
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Jasper International Pricing - Converted 

Line Item# Annual Pricing - Bid Monthly Pricing -

Annual Divided by 12 

4.10. 1 $ 2,955.00 $ 246.25 

4.10. 2 $ 160.00 $ 13.33 

4.10. 3 $ 160.00 $ 13.33 

4.10. 4 $ 160.00 $ 13.33 

4.10. 5 $ 798.00 $ 66.50 

4.10. 6 $ 150.00 $ 12.50 

4.10. 7 $ 298.00 $ 24.83 

4.10. 8 $ 66.00 $ 5.50 

4.10. 9 $ 66.00 $ 5.50 

4.10. 10 $ 629.00 $ 52.42 

4.10. 11 $ 629.00 $ 52.42 

4.10. 12 $ 51.00 $ 4.25 

4.10. 13 $ 498.00 $ 41.50 

4.10. 14 $ 498.00 $ 41.50 

4.10. 15 $ 498.00 $ 41.50 

4.10. 16 $ 498.00 $ 41.50 

4.10. 17 $ 498.00 $ 41.50 

4.10. 18 $ 498.00 $ 41.50 

4.10. 19 $ 498.00 $ 41.50 

4.10. 20 $ 428.00 $ 35.67 

4.10. 21 $ 372 .00 $ 31 .00 

4.10. 22 $ 372.00 $ 31.00 

4.10. 23 $ 198.00 $ 16.50 

4.10. 24 $ 88.00 $ 7.33 

4.10. 25 $ 232 .00 $ 19.33 

4.10. 26 $ 292 .00 $ 24.33 

4.10. 27 $ 998.00 $ 83.17 

4.10. 28 $ 622.00 $ 51.83 

4.10. 29 $ 622.00 $ 51.83 

4.10. 30 $ 998.00 $ 83.17 

4.10. 31 $ 263.00 $ 21.92 

4.10. 32 $ 159.00 $ 13.25 

4.10. 33 $ 159.00 $ 13.25 

4.10. 34 $ 133.00 $ 11.08 

4.10. 35 $ 133.00 $ 11.08 

4.10. 36 $ 133.00 $ 11.08 

4.10. 37 $ 133.00 $ 11.08 

4.10. 38 $ 133.00 $ 11.08 

4.10. 39 $ 133.00 $ 11.08 

4.10. 40 $ 133.00 $ 11.08 
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Jasper International Pricing - Converted 

Line Item# Annual Pricing - Bid Monthly Pricing -

Annual Divided by 12 

4.10. 41 $ 133.00 $ 11.08 

4.10. 42 $ 133.00 $ 11.08 

4.10. 43 $ 133.00 $ 11.08 

4.10. 44 $ 133.00 $ 11.08 

4.10. 45 $ 133.00 $ 11.08 

4.10. 46 $ 133.00 $ 11.08 

4.10. 47 $ 133.00 $ 11.08 

4.10. 48 $ 133.00 $ 11.08 

4.10. 49 $ 448.00 $ 37.33 

4.10. so $ 133.00 $ 11.08 

4.10. 51 $ 133.00 $ 11.08 

4.10. 52 $ 133.00 $ 11.08 

4.10. 53 $ 133.00 $ 11.08 

4.10. 54 $ 133.00 $ 11.08 

4.10. 55 $ 133.00 $ 11.08 

4.10. 56 $ 133.00 $ 11.08 

4.10. 57 $ 133.00 $ 11.08 

4.10. 58 $ 133.00 $ 11.08 

4.10. 59 $ 133.00 $ 11.08 

4.10. 60 $ 133.00 $ 11.08 

4.10. 61 $ 133.00 $ 11.08 

4.10. 62 $ 133.00 $ 11.08 

4.10. 63 $ 133.00 $ 11.08 

4.10. 64 $ 632.00 $ 52.67 

4.10. 65 $ 300.00 $ 25.00 

4.10. 66 $ 599.00 $ 49.92 

4.10. 67 $ 1,760.00 $ 146.67 
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RFU 27-8JUNl4 
Computer Hardware Maintenance & Repair Sen•ices 

Co.\'/ El't1luutio11 
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Jasper 

QTY Ori&inal Unit Pricing 

24(,.25 $ 

LUJ $ 

l.U.l $ 

12 .50 $ 

24.K.l $ 

5.50 $ 

5.50 $ 

52 .42 $ 

52.42 $ 

4 .25 $ 

4 1.50 $ 

41.5U S 

4I.SU $ 

41.50 $ 

,11.5() $ 

4 I.SU $ 

4 1.SO $ 

.• I \ltl $ 

JI .UO $ 

x., 17 S 

5 I XJ $ 

X3 17 $ 

3% lncrcnsc 

Jasper Jasper Jasper 

Exkndt-d Total ht Renewal Unit Price Ex lcnded Total - 1st Renewal 

25J.6-l $ 253.64 $ 

LU3 

13 .JJ 13.73 1.UJ $ 

lJ.3J 13 .73 $ 13.7.\ $ 

68.50 $ 

12.50 $ 12.88 $ 12.88 $ 

25.58 $ 25.58 $ 

5.SO $ 5.67 5.67 $ 

5.50 S 5.67 5.67 $ 

52 .42 S SJ .9') $ 53.'>9 $ 

52 42 53.99 53 .99 S 

4.25 S 4.38 4.38 $ 

41 .50 S 42.75 $ 42.75 $ 

41.50 $ 42.75 S 42.75 $ 

41.50 S 42.75 S 42.75 $ 

41 .50 $ 42.75 S 42.75 $ 

4I .SU 42.75 42-75 $ 

41.50 $ 42.75 S 42.75 $ 

4 !.SU S 42.75 $ 42.75 $ 

J567 36.74 $ 36. 74 $ 

Jl.()(1 31.9.' $ 31.')3 $ 

.<1 .00 $ 31 .<J.3 S 31.93 $ 

!(,.So $ 17.00 17.00 $ 

D J S 7.55 7.55 $ 

19.9 1 $ 19.91 $ 

24 .. >J 25.06 $ 

x., 17 $ 85 .66 85.GG '5 

53.J'J $ 53.W $ 

:il.X3 $ 5.139 $ SL\9 $ 

85.66 i 

22.57 $ 22.57 $ 
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3% Increase 

Jasper Jasper Jasper Jasper Jasper Jasper Jasper 

2nd Rcocwal Unit Price [,:tended Total - 2nd Rcnt•wal 3rtl Renewal Unit Prkc 3rd Ren,i,ul Unit Price 41h Rent'\' al Unit Price 4th Renewal Unit PriN' GRAN'D TOTAL 

26';) .08 $ 2(,<J ,08 279.85 $ 27'J.85 $ IJIO.o7 

I 4. 15 $ I 4. I 5 14,57 14 .57 15.15 S 15.15 $ 70.') .~ 

14.15 $ 14.1 5 S 14.57 $ 14 .57 15. 15 $ 15.15 $ 

14. 15 S 14 . 15 $ 14.57 S 14.57 15.15 $ 

70.5:i $ 7() 55 S 72.67 $ 72.67 S 75.57 S 75.57 $ 

1:U(, $ 13.2(, S 13.66 $ IH,6 14.21 S 1,1.2 1 $ (,(,j() 

2(, . .' 5 $ 26 .35 27.1-1 27.14 S 28.22 S 28.22 $ 1.l2 . ll 

5.lO 6.01 6.01 $ 6.25 S 6.25 $ 

5.XJ $ 5.:SJ 6.0 1 S 6.0 1 6.25 6.25 $ 

55.<il $ 55 .(, 1 57.28 57.28 59.57 59.57 $ 

55.61 $ 55 .61 S 57 .28 S 57.28 5~.57 S S'J.57 $ 

4.5 1 S 4.5! 4.64 4.64 4.83 4.83 $ 22 .6 1 

44.U3 $ 44 .u.:i $ 45.35 S 45.35 $ 47.16 $ 47.16 $ 220.7X 

4.t .(IJ -15 .35 $ •15.35 S 47. 16 47. 16 $ 220.7X 

44 .o.l $ 44.03 $ 45.35 45.35 $ 47 .16 $ 47. 16 $ 

44 .(1., $ 44 m t 45.35 $ ,15.35 47.16 $ 47. 16 $ 

44 .03 $ 44.03 $ 45.35 .S 45,35 $ 47. 16 S 47. 16 $ 

44 .0.l $ 44 0.l $ 45.35 45.35 47.16 $ 47 .16 $ 22U.7K 

44 .03 $ 4.t .(13 $ 45.35 $ 45.35 S 47.16 47. l6 $ 2211 7X 

.'7 .84 $ 37.X4 $ 38.<J7 S 38,97 40.53 S 40.5 3 $ 11:(975 

33.S7 .U,87 S 35.23 S 1(,4 ')2 

33.87 33.87 S 3-5,23 $ 

17 50 $ 17.50 l lHH $ 18.M S 18.75 $ 18 .75 $ 

7.78 7.7X $ 8.0 1 $ 8.01 

20.5 1 $ W.5! 21.13 21.1 3 $ 21 97 21.97 $ 

2.:5 .lC S 26.59 27.65 S 27.65 $ 77 8\ 1 

'XJ.88 5 ')4.51 $ 94 .51 $ 4.12 .45 

54 .'N $ 54 ')') $ 5664 S 5(,,64 $ 58 ') ! 5X.9! $ 

5-1.')') 54 .')') 56.64 S 56.64 58.91 $ 5S:J l $ 27)7(, 

Y0.88 $ 9U.8g i 94.51 $ 94 51 S 442 .45 

2:t.95 s 2.l .95 $ 2.t.9l S 24 .<J l 'ii ! IC-(,(1 



RFD 27-8J l/N24 
Computer Hardware Maintenance & Repair Services 

Linc Item H l Tai?.# 
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Jasper 

QTY Oricinal Unit Pricing 
SN 

6FTSA752KI 1.'U5 i, 

'JITl'CS:!15.1 IJ.25 $ 

7!U~S/\05978 I 1.08 $ 

•JAKKG,5017 11 .08 

I I.OX $ 
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3% 1nr.:n:os..-i 

Jasper Jasper Jasper 

E1 lcndt'd T ota l ht Rcm·"al Unit Price £,,.:tended Tot.I - Isl Renewa l 

1H,.5 $ 13.65 $ 

13.65 $ 1] .65 $ 

11 .IJX 11.42 $ 11.-42 $ 

I I.OX $ 11.-42 11.42 $ 

11.-42 I 1.42 $ 

11 .lJX 11.42 

I I.OX $ l 1.42 I\A2 $ 

11.08 $ I 1.42 $ 11.42 $ 

I I.OX $ 11.42 

l I.OX $ 11.42 11.42 $ 

1 LUX $ 11.42 11.42 $ 

I I.OK $ 11.42 $ 11.-42 $ 

11.(JX $ 11.42 1 l.42 $ 

I I.OX $ 11.42 $ 11.42 $ 

I ! .U8 11.42 $ 11.42 $ 

I I.DX $ 11.42 $ IL42 $ 

I l.(IK S I L42 $ 11.42 $ 

.18.45 s 
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J%1nt--rea~ 4% lncrea;,i.,: 

Jaspe r Jasper Jasper Jasper Jasper Jaspe r Jaspe r 

2nd Renewal Unit Price E:l.l<"mkd Total • 2ntl Rcnc,ul 3rd Renewal Uni l Price Jrd Rcnc,ul Unil Price 4th Rcnc,ul Unit Prict· ..Ith Rcrwwal Unit Pric..- GRAND TOTAL 
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11.76 $ 11.76 $ 12.1 I 12.1 1 12.60 s 12.60 $ 

1 l 7(, $ 11.7(, 12.1 ! 12.60 12.60 S 

11.7(, $ 117(, s 12. t I 12.11 $ 12.60 s 12.60 $ SX.')(, 

11 .7(, $ 11.76 $ 12. 11 $ 12.11 $ 12.60 $ !2.60 $ 

11.7(, $ 11.7(, 12. 11 12.60 s 12.60 $ 

11.76 $ 11. 7(, $ 12. 11 12.11 $ 12.(-0 12.60 $ 

1 ! 7(, $ l 1.7(, $ 12.11 $ 12. 11 $ 12.60 $ 12.60 S SX.'/(, 

11.76 $ 117(, 12.11 $ 12.11 s 12.60 12.60 $ 

11 .76 $ ! 1.76 12.11 12. 11 $ 12.60 $ 12.60 S 

11.76 $ 1!7(, $ 12.11 $ 12.11 $ 12.60 12.60 $ 5X.% 

!1.7(, $ 1176 $ 12.11 $ 12. 11 $ 12.GO $ !2.60 $ 

11.7(, $ 11 .7(, $ 12.11 $ 12.1'1 $ 12.60 $ 12.60 $ 

11.7(, $ 11.7(, $ 12.11 $ 12. l ! $ 12.60 s 12 .()() $ 58.% 

J') .(, \ $ ~•) (,I 40.R0 s -42.43 s 42...IJ $ 

11.76 $ 11.7(, 12.11 12.11 s 12.60 12.60 $ 58.')(, 

11 7(, $ 11 76 12.11 12. 11 12.60 $ 12.60 5 

11.7(, ll.7(, $ 12.11 $ 12. l 1 $ 12.60 s 12.60 $ 58.'I(, 

l l 7(, s 117(, 12. l I 12.11 12.60 $ 12.60 $ 

1\ .7(, $ \!7(, $ 12.11 s 12. I I $ I2.<io 12.6U $ 58 .'){, 

11 7(, 11.7(, $ 12. 11 $ 12. 11 12.60 12.f,O S 

1!7(, s \ ! 7(, 12.11 s 12. l 1 12.6<1 s 12.<,U $ 

11 7<, $ 117(, $ 12. 1 l s 12 .11 s 12.60 $ 12.(,0 $ 

1) 1(, s l l 7(, $ 12. 11 s 12 1 l $ 12 .60 $ 12.6U $ 

11 7(, $ 11 76 $ 12. 11 $ 12.1 ! $ !2.f,() 



RFB 27-SJllNH 
Computer Hardware Maintenance & Repair Services 

Lincltcm# I Tai!# 
-1 . [(J . (,( J 2-1.:!20 

-1 . IU <,7 

Co.'it Ewtluulirm 

11cm Dcsc ri tion SN 

Nntd,.,10\..: 

l'rinlcr 

!'rintcr 

l\1n:1s,mi.: ·r, ,11i:thl'll111k 
c1:.31 

Ul)KKC99l)•J 

l';i1ws"11i,; lnughhook Ol)KKC')') I (,(, 

cr-.,1 

l'a11:1s,111ic T1,ui,thho,,k (l ]) KKC9'J I 72 

CF-.•I 

l1an:isnni..: T,1ug.h\...,,o\..: Ol)KKC•)•JJMI. 
CF-JI 

Pana .,;1111ic ·1·,111g.hl"'"1\..: Fl. Ol·T1"1\4U'NO 
55 

OKI C7111)N /\K4 i\o.,(NJ51X) 

OK! C%50 AU HJ55492 

C,111, ,11 ·1"X-.\ (J(J(JMF I' AFMM(JUX85 

2nJ Rc11c11;d !'crioJ h1crc:1sc Pcrccntag.c 

.\% 

QTY 

J% lncrcosc 

Jasper Jasper Jasper Jasper 

Ori,inal Unit Pricina:: Extcndcd Total l~t Rcnt'wal Unit Pri~ Extended Total- Isl Renewal 

I I. \IX $ l I.UK 11.42 S 11.42 S 

11.PX $ I I.OX 11.42 11.42 $ 

I I.OX $ 11.-12 $ 11.42 $ 

I I.OX $ 11 .(JX 11.42 $ 11.42 $ 

52.(,7 $ 54.25 54 .25 $ 

25.UO $ 25 .U<.J 25.75 $ 25.75 $ 

51.41 51.4 1 $ 

151.07 151.07 $ 

Page~ of 3 

4% lncrcas~ 

Jasper Jasper Jasper Jasper Jasper Jasper Jasper 

2nd Renewal Unit Price Extended Total. 2ml RcfK'wal 3rd Renewal Unit Price Jrd Renewal Unit Price .Ith Rcne"al Unit Price ,llh Renewal Uni! Prict• GRAND TOTAL 

11.7(, $ 12. 11 $ 12.11 12.60 $ 12.60 $ 

1 l.7(, $ 11.7(, 12.11 12. 11 12.fiJ S 12.60 $ 

11.7(, $ 11 .7(, $ 12.1 l 12.11 $ 12.60 12.60 $ 

11.7(, $ 11.7(, 12.11 12 .11 S 12.60 S 12.60 $ 

55 .X7 $ 55.X7 $ 57.55 57.55 $ 59.85 59.&5 $ 2XIJ. l') 

2(,.52 $ 26.52 27.Jl S 27,J2 $ 2K41 S 28..t\ $ ll> oo 

52.% $ 54.55 54 .55 56.73 S 56.7] $ 2(,5.5(, 

155.N! $ 155 .60 160.27 160.27 $ 166.68 16(1.68 $ 7X0.2X 

ALL ITEMS ALL CONTRACT PERIODS GRAND TOTAL IO,U21.<J.\ 



RFB 27-SJUNH 
Compull'r Hardware Maintenance & Repair Services 

Cost El'l1l11t1tio11 

!fem Dcscrintion SN 
.J . llJ. I ](,}74 Dn,.:um..:111 S.:a1111,.;1 S1rn1r1U: l.'.\ -We C2(,I\IU(,7[{ 

-L IU l(,pK_\ l:h.:umc111 Sc:11111c1 Fujitsu 5751K.' 1()21(,2 

-LI O 160K2 l)o,.:um..:nt S..:mm..:1 Fujitsu 5750l' I020IU, 

-U0 I6.l!N D,11;urn..:nt S..:ann..:1 Fujitsu 5750C IO(,(,KJ 

.j _ l\J 245L! D,xum..:111 S-:,111n..:1 Fujit~u 1:1 77(1(1 /\l !-l l)/\U055r, 

.J . 10. 15.156 Sn,..:1 111' l'ro[.i;1nl M[ ,.l5ll (i-lp { IS F(,07N21l'J 

Jf,!7J Snn!r 1 IP Pn1l.i:m1 DU6o05 l lSE71(,Noll 

-UO 

.J , 10. 

IX5<,-I S_:p.,:r 111' Pr11l .i1111l l)IJ<,O (i7 \JSl•:.Uoi\CN/\ 

I X)XK S..:r-.-..:1 I !1' ! \ , ,l .ia111 1)1 .H,O (i7 l /Sl ·:33-ICl)MC 

.J .10 lU 17'>K5 S,:1T<.!r 111' Pru] .i .1111 Dl .. lKU (i7 lJ Sl-:2161 SWP 

I lo 11 IXU(,2 I II' l'n,Li,111! l)UKu (i7 \JSF22<,KKWP 

-LIO 12 [•JJXO ! II' l'rnl.ian! l)U(,Oc (iK ~-IXQ-1 .H (IOl'M 

-Uo I.' 21'127 

.J . [O I(, 2I9JU Cku1pi:-.:CP-4UTB -II Rl6.l53K-I 

4 10 17 2 l•J.' ! 

Cka rpi:-.: l"fl-40Tll -118164-1•121 

4. IU l'J 2l'J:l.l S..:n..:1 Cka1pixl'P--IOTll -l!Xl(,4-1-122 

-LllJ 211 22272 Ck;upi:-.: Cl'-20lB -I 1Sl63X.J 0l 

.J.W 11 2227.\ S,:t\"<.!1 Ddl l'.Jg..: 52(10 BRl)S2X2 

S,:n..:r lkl! 1-:Ji,:c 52llU llRI IN282 

I !!'!': [)I JK(J MXQ72UUl7X 

Scr\"Cr Dell 1'1111,:rEJg..: R:nu KKFN7M2 

.J . 1(1 l kll l'n11..:rl·:Jg..: 10-IU 

S-:1"\"cl Dell P,lll..:rhlg..: Rr,Jo 

.J . IU 27 :::-1(,[(I I >ell 1'1111..:rl '.Ji,:c R7-IO 

-L ill :::x 2461 t l)dl 1'011..:rh !i,:c R5.J(I •J215NS3 

11(1 2') 2-'715 

lklll'"11..:d·:,Jgc lO-lo ll2S.II.C.' 

.,1 2(1151 

NPA 

QTY Ori&inal Unit Pricing 

1.l.20 $ 

1."UO $ 

I.UCI $ 

I .UO $ 

1120 $ 

IJ .2U $ 

1., .20 $ 

13 .20 $ 

l.l .2U $ 

4•}.50 $ 

-19 50 $ 

-l'J.50 $ 

2-1 .211 $ 

2-1 .20 $ 

I.Uo S 

2-1 .20 $ 

13 20 $ 

.lK 50 $ 

, ,1 j(J $ 

-1'1.5(1 $ 

3% lncr.:nsc 

NPA NPA NPA 

E,;tcndcd Tolal ht ReM,111.I Unit Price Extended Total - Isl Rcncw•I 

50.99 $ 50.99 $ 

1.:uo s 13.60 13.60 $ 

LUO $ 13.60 13.60 $ 

ll2(1 S J.l60 D .60 $ 

I.Ull S 13.60 $ 13.60 $ 

1no s 13 .60 $ 

l.UO $ 13.60 $ D .60 $ 

LUO $ 13.60 S 1.H,O $ 

1.UtJ $ 1.1.60 $ 13.60 $ 

13 20 $ 13.60 13.60 $ 

1., 20 D .60 $ LUO $ 

LUO 13.60 S IJ .60 $ 

50.'~9 $ 50.9'.l $ 

50.<J') $ 50.99 $ 

-19.511 $ 50.99 S 50.99 

-l'J.5() S 50.99 $ 50.9'.l $ 

-l'J.50 $ 50.<)<J $ 50.99 $ 

-l 'J.50 S 50.99 $ 50.99 $ 

-1 1).5{) S S0.99 $ 50.99 $ 

-i'J.5() $ 50.')') S 

2-1.20 S 24.'}3 24.93 $ 

2-1 .2(1 $ 24.93 $ 24 .93 $ 

1.l.20 $ 1.160 13.60 $ 

2-1.20 $ 24 .93 $ 24.'JJ $ 

1., .20 $ 13.60 S IJ .6CJ $ 

27.Sll $ 2lU3 $ 

JX 5(1 $ 39.66 $ 

-l'.151) $ 50.99 $ 50.99 $ 

50.99 $ 

.'X 5!1 S .\IJ.6(, $ 

Page 1 of.~ 

3% hwn::a sc: 

NPA NPA NPA NPA NPA NPA NPA 

2nd Rcnt'wal Unit Prkc Extended Total - 2nd Rcnc,nl 3rd Renewal Unil Price 3rd Rt'ncwa l Unit Pri« ~lh Rcm'\lal Unit Price GRAND TOTAL 

52 .5! $ 52.51 S 54.09 5.J .01) $ 55.71 $ 55.7 1 $ 

].U)() s 14.42 $ 1 4 . ➔2 14.86 S 14.86 $ 70.Ul'l 

1-1 .(1() $ I4.tl(J S 14.42 $ 14.42 S 14 .86 $ 14.86 $ 71UJK 

lH.IU $ I-1 .U(l S 14.42 14.42 14.86 14.86 $ 7U .tlK 

14.UO $ 14.00 S 14.42 $ 14.42 14.8<, 14.86 $ 70.\ll'l 

1-1.(l(J $ I-1 .0(J 14A2 14.42 I -I .Ki> S 70.0X 

1-U.IU $ 14.42 14.42 $ l•tS<, $ 14 .86 $ 7uox 

I-I .Oil $ I-1 .l/iJ 14.42 $ 14 42 $ 14.86 14.86 $ 7tllJX 

I-I .VO 1-1 .0() $ 14.42 $ 14.42 $ 1-1 .86 $ 14.86 $ 70.l/X 

1-1 .(1( 1 $ ! -1 .IKI $ 14.42 14.42 S 14.86 $ 14.86 $ 7llJJK 

1-1 .(/iJ S 14.42 S 14.42 14.&; $ l-1 .86 $ 7tJ.\lf< 

1-1.(Kl $ 1-1 .UO $ 14.42 S 14.42 S 14 86 $ 7o.UX 

52.5! S 52.51 54 .09 54.0<) 55.71 55 .7! $ 

52 .51 $ 52 .51 S 54.09 S 54.09 55.71 55.7 1 $ 

52.5 1 $ 52 .51 S 54.09 $ 5-t.09 $ 55.71 $ 55.71 $ 

52 51 $ 52 .51 54.09 54.09 S 55 71 55.71 $ Y,2.Xu 

52.51 $ 52 .51 54.09 54.09 $ 55.71 $ 55.71 $ 

52.5 1 $ 52.5 1 $ 54 .09 54.09 $ 55.71 55.71 $ 

52 .51 $ 54 .(19 54.09 55.71 S 55.71 :S 

52 .51 $ 52 .51 $ 54.09 $ 55.71 $ 55.71 $ 

25.(,7 $ 25.(,7 26.44 $ 26A4 $ 27 .24 $ 27.24 $ 12X -IX 

25(,1 $ 25 .(,7 26.4-1 S 26.4 4 S 27 .24 $ 27 .24 $ I2)(.-ll'l 

I.J .oo S 14.00 14.42 $ 14.-12 14.K6 $ 701/l'l 

25 .(,7 $ 15.(,7 26.44 26.44 S 27,24 $ 27.24 $ 

IHJ\I $ l-1 .IKI $ 14.42 S 14.42 $ 14.!¼ S 14 .86 S 711(1/\ 

2') \ 7 30.05 $ 30.05 S 30. '}5 $ 30.')5 

-Ill X4 $ -12.o? 42.07 $ HJ .1 43 . .:n s 

52.51 54.09 S 54.0'J $ 55.71 S 55.71 $ 

52 .51 $ 52 SI $ 5-1.09 $ 55.71 $ 55.71 S 

lo X-1 $ -lll .K-1 42 .07 $ 42.07 S 4.l.33 2\1-1-IO 

25 (,1 S 25.(,1 26.4-l $ 27 .2-1 :i 



RFB 27-8JllN24 
Computer Hardware Maintenance & Repair Services 

Uo, Item# I T" # 

-U0 

-U0 _7,5 23215 

-U0 J(, 2J21(, 

-1 . Ju .,1 :n211 

-LI O 

-UlJ 

-l](J 

-LIU 

-U 0 -'7 2-1 2!!7 

-I .Ill 

-I . IV 

-l[ (J 2-12 IU 

51 :!-L:!11 

2-1212 

-Li ll 2-L~ !3 

-11 \1 5-1 2-C'.!-I 

-I 10. 55 2-12!5 

..i Jt_, 

.l.J (I 

-1\ (J 

-lll l .::-12 1•1 

('o.,·t E1•aluatio11 

)h'm Dcscri lion 

N,,tdl<lllk 

N,11':l'l\ll >k 

l'anas,ini..:: T1,ug.hhook 
CF-5-1 

Pa11;1son i..: loui:-hhook 
CF-JI 

Pa11as11ni..: ·1·11ui;hh1111k 
cI :.31 

!l;1n:1s,,ni..: ·rnughh11<.1k 
ci:-.,I 

P,1nasnni,.; loughl'l\>ok 
cr-.,I 

l'arn1s,>11i..: T, ,up.h\1<"'1k 
CF-.>I 

l'a11as,1ni..:T,1ui;hl'l\1<.1k 
cI: . .11 

1':11w .,, ,11i ..: T1•ughl"'"'1k 
CF-.>l 

l1:1nas,,11 i,.; T,1ughl"-•llk 
CF-Jl 

l'anas,,ni..: ·r,,11):.hl1<"'" 
c 1:.31 

l'anasoni..: ·r,,ui;hb,1<.1k 
CF-.l l 

Pana .,oni,.; loup.hl1<1<.1k 

l'nna.~,,nic T,1ughl"'"''k 
LT-31 

l':111;1.~,,ni..: T,,ughl1<.ll•k 
L"F-31 

Pa1111s11ni,.; T,1u!'hl'l\1<.lk 
CF-:.1 

!'ana.,,111i..: ·1·,,ut,!h l"'"'k 
LT-J I 

l';i1ws, ,11 i..: ·1·1,u)!.h\'ll1<.>k 

<:F-31 

P:1n.is,,11i..: r,1u::hl1<",k 
CF-.<! 

l'anas,,nic T,1111:-hl'l\><>k 
CF-JI 

l\111aso11i..: 1"<1ui,:hl1<1<.>k 
LT-JI 

l'an;1~,111 1~· 1·,,u!'hl" "'k 
L"F-.~I 

l'a11a .,, ,1u ,.; [,,ui;hl""'k 
CF-J! 

l'arn1s,1111,.; T,,ughl1<.1<.1i-; 
<.T-.<\ 

l',1nil,;,,111..:T,,u):.h!"'"'I-. 

CF-'1 

l'anas,1111,.; l'"U!!hl-..1<.1!-; 
LT -.~ I 

NPA NPA 

QTY Ori1inal Unit Pricing E~lcndcd Total 

SN 
(,Fl"SA752Xl 

7!JKSJ\ll597X 

<JAKKC<,50!7 l'J.XO S 

['J.XO $ 

<JJ\KKC6.J')75 !'J.X() $ 

19.XO $ 

•KiKKCXO()XX !'J.l({I $ 

'l(IKKCR(KJ.17 

•JGKKUu<J4U l'I .XO $ 

•J(iKKCX00.~5 l'J.X!I $ 

'J<iKKCRllU.J(, I') XU $ 

')(iKKC:SO<J57 l'J.8U $ 

<JCiKKCXOU42 

<JGKKC7'J247 l <J .80 $ 

<)OKKCXUO.'I 1•um s 

%KKCK00 51 

UDKKC'J') IC,2 l'J .XU $ 

un KKl''J') l 54 

1'1.XO S 

Ul)KKL.'J•Jl55 \<J_:,((I $ 

Ul)KKC•J•J[)\1 

t ll)KKl'•)•JI)(, 

J% !ncrens~ 

NPA NPA 

bt Renewal Unit Price ExtendcdToi.1 - 1st Renewal 

l 'J.l((J $ 20 .. W $ 20 .. N $ 

I'/ XO $ 20.J9 2039 $ 

l'J.XU $ 20.39 $ 10.39 $ 

20.39 S 20.39 $ 

20.J<J S 20.39 $ 

l'J.XO $ 20.39 $ 20.39 $ 

l'J XU $ 20.39 20.39 $ 

20 . .19 S 20.39 $ 

l'J.X(J S 20. 39 S 20.3'} $ 

20 .. N S 20.3') $ 

l'J.XO 20.39 S 2U.39 $ 

l 'J X(I $ 2039 S 20.39 $ 

19.X\I 20.:w 20.39 $ 

l'J.80 $ 20.39 20.39 $ 

20.39 $ 

l'J.KlJ 20.39 S 20.39 $ 

l'J.KO $ 20..'9 S 20.3') :S 

l 'JJ{(I $ 20.39 $ 

l'J XU $ 20 .. W $ 20.39 S 

20.3') S 20 .. l9 $ 

2039 20 .. N $ 

20 .. N $ 20.39 

2U.39 $ 

I'/ X\I $ 20J') $ 

l 'J XO $ 20.39 20 .. N .$ 

l 'J XP 

2U .. W $ 

Page 2 of 3 

~'½, lm:r..::as..: J% [n...,rc:i sc 

NPA NPA NPA NPA NPA NPA NPA 

2nd Renewal Uni! Price El:k·ndcd Tolal • 2nd Renewal Jnl Renewal Unit Price.· Jnl Rt•nc\\al Unil Price -'lh RcncnaJ Unit Price -Uh Rc~wal Unit Price GRAND TOTAL 

21.UI $ 21.(H S 21.64 $ 22.29 $ 22.29 $ 1\15. 12 

21.01 $ ll.01 $ 2164 21.64 $ 22.29 S 22 .29 $ 105.12 

21.UI $ 21.01 21 .64 11.64 12.19 12.29 $ 1(15. 12 

21.0l 2 1.UI 21.64 2 1.64 22 .29 22.29 $ 105 .12 

21 .01 $ 21.01 21 .64 22 .29 S 22 .29 $ 

21.UI $ 21 0 1 $ 11 .M 21.64 S 22 .N $ 22.29 $ IU512 

21 .01 $ 21.lJI S 21 .64 21.64 22.29 $ 22.29 $ 105.12 

.?:LU I $ 2 1.ol 21 ,64 2 1.6-l 22.29 22 .29 $ }()5. 12 

21.Ul $ 21.0 1 S 21 .64 21.64 S 22.l'J s 22 .29 $ 

2111[ 21.64 2164 22.29 22 .29 $ Ill) 12 

21.l!I 21.64 $ 21 .64 22 29 $ l\15. 12 

21 .64 21.6-1 $ 22 29 $ lilS .L: 

21.lll $ 21.(tl S 21.64 $ 2 1.64 S 22.29 S 22.29 $ 1()5. 12 

21.0l $ 21.0 1 21 .64 21 .(>-i 22.29 $ 22.29 S 

21.0 1 $ 21.64 $ 2L64 $ 22 .29 $ 22 .2'> $ 105. 12 

21.0 I $ 21.64 21 .64 22 .29 22.29 $ IU5 12 

21.0l $ 21 UI S 21.64 $ 21.64 S 22.29 22.:!9 S 105. 12 

.l5 .Ul $ 36.06 36.06 $ 37.14 S 175.211 

21 UI $ 21 IJ I S 21.64 S 21.64 S 22.29 S 22.29 S lt15 12 

21.0 \ S 21 lll $ 21.64 S 11 .64 22.29 

21 ll l $ 21 .01 S 21.64 S 21.64 $ 12.2') 22.2'> $ 1()5 12 

21.U[ $ 21.0! S 21 6-1 $ 21.M S 22 29 $ 22.29 $ !0512 

21.Ul S 21 \J I S 21 .64 21.M S 22.29 S 22.29 $ IU) . I1 

21 \II $ 21 Ill 21.64 21 64 21.2') $ 22.2') $ !05 12 

21 O! $ 21.64 $ 21.64 $ 22.29 $ 22.29 S 

21 l ll $ 21 .\ ll S 21 .6-1 21.6.J $ 2229 21.2') S \\15 12 

21 ti [ 'S 11.64 $ 21.64 :i, 22.l'J S 22.29 $ IP5 11 

!! 1> 1 !!(I [ 21.64 S 21M $ 



RFB 27-8JUN2-! 
Computer Hardwar(' Maintenance,& Repail' Sen-ices 

Liocll<'m# I T:11.! # 

-I lO (,(I ~All\/ 

-1.lu (,t HJN 

-UU (,.\ 20 121 

-1 . 10 (, -1 2-1-Bu 

-1.10 65 

-UO 6(, l'rinlcr 

,l.Jll. 67 

('rHt Em/1111tio11 

ll l'lll Dl'sui lion 
l1:111as,,111c T,1ughh111,k 

CF-.• I 

SN 
Ol)KKC 1J1JIS 1J 

l'.111,1s.,nic loughh,11.1k ODKKC<J<Jlf,f, 
CF-.•1 

l'an:isonic T"ll!,!-hhook 0DKKC'J9172 
Cl.--.ll 

1'11nas,111 ic ·1·,n1t1-hh1111k Ul)KKC')'l 1(,8 
CF-.~1 

l'anas,mic Tnughhuok Fl. (J l·TIA-IU')'J(I 

OKI C711DN AK-li\OJIJ'J.,51X) 

OKI C%5U AL-I 1055-PJ2 

C1nnn TX--l(l(KlMFP AFMMUOSXS 

V¼, 

QTY 

3% Jncr..:asc 

NPA NPA NPA NPA 

Ori&inaJ Unit Pricing Extcmkd Total ht Rcm:'lal Unit Price E.,;fendcd Total - Isl Renewal 

10 .. l9 $ 

l'J .K\I $ !'J .K(I $ 20.3') $ 20.39 $ 

l<J.KO 20.]9 20.39 $ 

l'J.80 $ 20.39 20.39 $ 

19.80 S 20.Y) 20.39 $ 

2-120 $ 2UU S 24.93 S 24 .93 $ 

2-1 .20 $ 2-1.20 $ 24.93 $ 2-1 .9.l $ 

82 .5(1 $ 82.S(J S 84.98 $ 

Page 3 of 3 

.VV., ln..:n:as,.: 

NPA NPA NPA NPA NPA NPA NPA 

2nd Rcnl'wal Unit Price Extended Total - 2n1I Renl'w■ I 3rd Rcn{"ft·■ l Unil Price 3rd Rcncwal Unit Price 4th Rcrn.• ll ■ I Unit Pri~ ..Ith Renewal Uni! Pricr• GRANO TOTAL 

21.0I $ 21.01 S 21 .64 21.64 22 .29 22,2'> $ lllS. 12 

21.01 $ .21.0l $ 21 .64 21.64 22.29 S 22.29 $ 

21.UI $ 2UJ1 21 .64 22.29 $ 22 .29 $ 1115 . 12 

21.01 $ 21.01 $ 21.6-4 21.64 S 22.29 22.29 $ 105. 12 

21.UI $ 21.01 21.64 $ 21.64 $ 22 .29 $ 22.29 $ 1(15. 12 

25.(,7 $ 25.C,7 $ 26.H 26.44 $ 27.H $ 27.24 $ 12R.-IX 

25.(,7 $ 25.C,7 26.44 S 27.:!4 27.2-1 $ 128.-18 

87 .52 $ S7 .52 S 90.15 $ 90.15 $ n .ss s 92.85 -IJ 8.0(J 

ALL ITEMS ALL CONTRACT PERIODS GRAND TOTAL 9,1175.46 



Bid Tabulation: RFH 27-18,JllN24 - Computer Hardware Maintenance and Repair Services 

Bidder 1: Bidder 2: Bidder 3: Bidder 4: 

Line Item# Tag# Item Descri11tion SN Dynamic Advantage, Inc. AMTEK Computer Services NPA Computers, Inc. The Jasper Group International 

16174 
Document 

SmartLF Cx 40e C2610067R 
4.10. 1 Scanner $ 65.00 $ 58.33 $ 49.50 $ 2,955.00 

16083 
Document 

Fujitsu 5750C 102162 
4.10. 2 Scanner $ 14.00 $ 74.67 $ 13.20 $ 160.00 

16082 
Document 

Fujitsu 5750C 102086 
4.10. 3 Scanner $ 14.00 $ 74.67 $ 13.20 $ 160.00 

16389 
Document 

Fujitsu 5750C 106683 
4.10. 4 Scanner $ 14.00 $ 74.67 $ 13.20 $ 160.00 

24512 
Document 

Fujitsu Fl 7700 AU4DA00556 
4.10. s Scanner $ 14.00 $ 133.33 $ 13.20 $ 798.00 

15356 Server 
HP ProLiant ML350 

USE607N289 
4.10. 6 G4u $ 14.00 $ 22.50 $ 13.20 $ 150.00 

4.10. 7 
16173 Server HP ProLiant DL360 G5 USE716NOTI 

$ 14.00 $ 24.00 $ 13.20 s 298.00 

18564 Server 
4.10. 8 

HP ProLiant DL360 G7 USE330ACNA 
$ 14.00 $ 57.58 $ 13.20 $ 66.00 

4.10. 9 
18588 Server HP ProLiant DL360 G7 USE334CDMC 

$ 14.00 $ 57.58 s 13.20 s 66.00 

4.10. 10 
17985 Server HP ProLiant DL380 G7 USE2161SWP 

$ 14.00 $ 66.50 $ 13.20 $ 629.00 

4.10. 11 
18062 Sen1er HP ProLiant DL380 G7 USE22688WP 

$ 14.00 $ 66.50 $ 13.20 $ 629.00 

19380 Server 
HP ProLiant DL360e 

MXQ43700PM 
4.10. 12 GS $ 14.00 $ 57.58 $ 13.20 $ 51.00 

21926 Server Clearpix CP-40TB 4181635386 
4.10. 13 $ 14.00 T&M -See Bid $ 49.50 $ 498.00 

21927 Server Clearpix CP-40TB 4 181635383 
4.10. 14 $ 14.00 T&M-See Bid $ 49.50 $ 498.00 

21928 Server Clearpix CP-40TB 4181635385 
$ 4.10. 15 $ 14.00 T&M -See Bid 49.50 $ 498.00 

21929 Server Clearpix CP-40TB 4181635384 
4.10. 16 $ 14.00 T&M-See Bid $ 49.50 $ 498.00 

21930 
4.10. 17 

Server Clearpix CP-40TB 4181635387 
No Bid T&M-See Bid $ 49.50 $ 498.00 

21931 Server Clearpix CP-40TB 4181644421 
4.10. 18 $ 14.00 T&M -See Bid $ 49.50 $ 498.00 

21932 Server Clearpix CP-40TB 4181644422 
4.10. 19 $ 14.00 T&M-See Bid $ 49.50 s 498.00 

21933 Server Clcarpix CP-20TB 4181638401 
4.10. 20 s 14.00 T&M -See Bid s 49.50 s 428.00 

22272 Server Dell Edge 5200 BRDS282 
4.10. 21 s 14.00 s 41.67 s 24.20 s 372.00 

22273 Server Dell Edge 5200 BRHN282 
4.10. 22 s 14.00 $ 41.67 s 24.20 $ 372.00 

22159 Server HPE DL380 MXQ7200!78 
4.10. 23 s 14.00 s 66.50 s 13.20 $ 198.00 

22302 Server Dell l'owerEdge RJJO 88FN7M2 
4.10. 24 $ 14.00 s 17.67 $ 24.20 s 88.00 
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23553 Server Dell PowerEdge R340 3TY93W2 

4.10. 25 $ 14.00 $ 14.83 $ 13.20 $ 232.00 

20051 Server Dell PowerEdge R630 9FDW482 

4.10. 26 $ 14.00 $ 38.42 $ 27.50 $ 292.00 

23552 Server Dell PowcrEdge R 740 37Q93W2 

4.10. 27 $ 14.00 $ 39.33 $ 38.50 $ 998.00 

24610 Server Dell PowerEdge R540 9275N83 

4.10. 28 $ 14.00 $ 60.83 $ 49.50 $ 922.00 

24611 Server Dell l'owcrEdge R540 9276N83 

4.10. 29 $ 14.00 $ 60.83 $ 49.50 $ 922.00 

24715 Server Dell PowerEdge R 740 B2SJZC3 
4.10. 30 $ 14.00 $ 39.33 $ 38.50 s 998.00 

23222 Server Dell PowerEdge R440 GQSS9T2 
4.10. 31 s 14.00 s 44.83 s 24.20 s 263.00 

20151 Notebook 
Panasonic Toughbook 

6FTSA75281 
CF-54 

4.10. 32 s 20.00 $ 15.67 s 19.80 s 159.00 

23606 Notebook 
Panasonic Toughbook 

9FTTC52153 
CF-54 

4.10. 33 $ 20.00 s 15.67 s 19.80 $ 159.00 

22027 Notebook 
Panasonic Toughbook 

7BKSA05978 
CF-31 

4.10. 34 $ 20.00 $ 15.67 s 19.80 s 133.00 

23208 Notebook 
Panasonic Toughbook 

9AKKC65017 
CF-31 

4.10. 35 $ 20.00 $ 15.67 s 19.80 s 133.00 

23215 Notebook 
Panasonic Toughbook 

9AKKC64986 
CF-31 

4.10. 36 s 20.00 $ 15.67 $ 19.80 s 133.00 

23216 Notebook 
Panasonic Toughbook 

9Al(KC64975 
CF-31 

4.10. 37 $ 20.00 s 15.67 s 19.80 s 133.00 

23217 Notebook 
Panasornc Toughbook 

9AKl(C64995 
CF-31 

4.10. 38 s 20.00 s 15.67 s 19.80 s 133.00 

13641 Notebook 
Panasonic Toughbook 

9GK"-C80088 
CF-JI 

4.10. 39 s 20.00 s 15.67 s 19.80 s 133.00 

23640 Notebook 
l'miasonic Toughbook 

9G"-"-C80037 
CF-31 

4.10. 40 $ 20.00 s 15.67 s 19.80 s 133.00 
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23639 Notebook 
Panasonic Toughbook 

9GKKC80040 
CF-3I 

4.10. 41 $ 20.00 $ 15.67 $ 19.80 $ 133.00 

23638 Notebook 
Panasonic Toughbook 

9GKKC80035 
CF-3I 

4.10. 42 $ 20.00 $ 15.67 $ 19.80 $ 133.00 

23637 Notebook 
Panasonic Toughbook 

9GKKC80046 
CF-3I 

4.10. 43 s 20.00 $ 15.67 s 19.80 s 133.00 

23636 Notebook 
Panasonic Toughbook 

9GKKC80057 
4.10. 44 CF-31 s 20.00 s 15.67 $ 19.80 s 133.00 

23634 Notebook 
Panasonic Toughbook 

9GKKC80042 
CF-3I 

4.10. 45 s 20.00 s 15.67 s 19.80 s 133.00 

23633 Notebook 
Panasonic Toughbook 

9GKKC79247 
CF-31 

4.10. 46 s 20.00 s 15.67 s 19.80 s 133.00 

23632 Notebook 
Panasonic Toughbook 

9GKKC80031 
CF-31 

4.10. 47 $ 20.00 $ 15.67 $ 19.80 $ 133.00 

23631 Notebook 
Panasonic Toughbook 

9GKKC80051 
CF-31 

4.10. 48 s 20.00 s 15.67 s 19.80 s 133.00 

4.10. 49 23944 Server Clearpix CP-9TB 4181939738 s 20.00 T&M -See Bid s 33.00 s 448.00 

24207 Notebook 
Panasonic Toughbook 

0DKKC99162 
4.10. so CF-31 s 20.00 s 15.67 $ 19.80 $ 133.00 

24208 Notebook 
Panasonic Toughbook 

0DKKC99154 
4.10. 51 CF-31 s 20.00 s 15.67 $ 19.80 s 133.00 

24209 Notebook 
Panasonic Toughbook 

0DKKC99l57 
4.10. 52 CF-31 $ 20.00 s 15.67 s 19.80 s 133.00 

24210 Notebook 
Panasonic Toughbook 

0DKKC99151 
4.10. 53 CF-31 $ 20.00 s 15.67 s 19.80 s 133.00 

24211 Notebook 
Panasonic Toughbook 

0DKKC99155 
4.10. 54 CF-3I s 20.00 s 15.67 s 19.80 s 133.00 

24212 Notebook 
Panasonic Toughbook 

0DKKC99150 
4.10. 55 CF-31 $ 20.00 s 15.57 s 19.80 s 133.00 

24213 Notebook 
Panasonic Toughbook 

0DKKC99158 
4.10. 56 CF-JI s 20.00 s 15.67 s 19.80 s 133.00 

24214 Notebook 
Panasonic Toughbook 

0DKKC99156 
4.10. 57 CF-31 s 20.00 s 15.57 s 19.80 s 133.00 

24215 Notebook 
Panasonic Toughbook 

0DKKC99l52 
4.10. 58 CF-3I s 20.00 s 15.67 s 19.80 s 133.00 

24216 Notebook 
Panasonic Toughbook 

0DKKC99153 
4.10. 59 CF-3I s 20.00 s 15.67 s 19.80 s 133.00 

24217 Notebook 
Panasonic Toughbook 

0DKKC99159 
4.10. 60 CF-3I s 20.00 s 15.67 s 19.80 s 133.00 

24218 Notebook 
Panasonic Toughbook 

0DKKC99166 
4.10. 61 CF-31 s 20.00 s 15.67 s 19.80 s 133.00 

24219 Notebook 
Panasonic Toughbook 

0DKKC99I72 
4.10. 62 CF-3I s 20.00 s 15.67 s 19.80 s 133.00 
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24220 Notebook 
Panasonic Toughbook . 

0DKKC99 168 
4.10. 63 CF-3 I $ 20.00 $ 15.67 $ 19.80 $ 133.00 

24379 Notebook 
Panasonic Toughbook 

0FTTA40990 
4.10. 64 FZ-55 $ 20.00 $ 15 .67 $ 19.80 $ 632.00 

23853 Prin ter 
4.10. 65 

OKI C7 11DN AK4A030935DO 
$ 20.00 $ 37.50 $ 24.20 $ 300.00 

20 129 Printer OKI C9650 AL4 1055492 
$ $ 4.10. 66 $ 20.00 $ 37.50 24.20 599.00 

24430 Plotter Canon TX-4000MFP AFMM00885 
4.10. 67 $ 200.00 $ 66.67 $ 82. 50 $ 1,760.00 

Co-Op? Unknown Yes Yes Yes 

First Renewal Perce ntage Increase Adjustment 0% 5% 3% 3% 

Second Renewal Perce nta ge Increase Adjustment 0% 3% 3% 3% 

Third Re newal Percentage Increase Adjust ment 0% 3% 3% 3% 

Fourth Renewal Perce ntage Increase Adj ustment 0% 2% 3% 4% 

NO BIDS: M arco technology and TEK Computers 
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